BID TABULATION

Standby Generators Installations For Sewer Lift Stations

City of Baton Rouge, Parish of East Baton Rouge

Project No. 09-PS-BD-0037

Addendum TWO
Bid Date: 7/29/2010 |
REF NO. Description Quantity | Unit of Measure Unit Price | U sion | Unit Price | Unit Price Extension |  Unit Price | Unit Price Extension |  Unit Price | Unit Price Extens UnitPrice | Unit Price Unit Price | Unit Price Extension |
2020300 Removal of Concrete Pavement 500 S5Y $ 12001 § 600000 % 2100 § 10,500.00 NO BID $ 4000 § 20,000.00 | § 2310 % 11,550,00 | § 1050 | § 5,250.00
2020900 Sawcutting 1500 LF $ 8.00|§ 12,000.00 | § 9.00| % 13,500.00 NO BID $ 1000 % 1500000 | § 935§ 14,025.00 | § 10.00 | § 15,000.00
2030100 General Excavalion 200 cY $ 1200 % 240000 ] § 2500 % 5,000.00 NO BID $ 100.00 | § 20,00000 ) § 2970 | % 594000 § 25008 5,000.00
2030200 Embankment 1938 CY $ 2400 % 4651200 ) § 12500 | § 242,250.00 NOBID $ 65.00|% 125970.00 | $ 2750 | § 53,295.00| § 26.00 |8 50,388.00
9020106 Chain Link Fence - 6 Ft. Height 6065 LF $ 4307 | § 261,21955 | § 2900 § 175,885.00 NO BID $ 1200 § 72,780.00) § 1650 | § 10007250 | $ 3062 |8 185,710.30
9020712 12 FL. Wide Chain Link Double Gate - 6 ft. Height 91 EACH $ 97350 | § 8858850 | § 900.00 | § 81,900.00 NO BID ) 800.00 | $ 72800.00) § 660.00 | § 60,060.00 | § 428.84 | § 39,024.44
9021408 8 Ft. Wood Fence 15951 LF $ 525118 B37,587.01 | § 330018 526,383.00 NO BID $ 2400 § 382,824.00 | § 3300 % 526,383.00 | § 41788 666,432.78
9030200 Temporary Hay Bales 50 EACH $ 17.76 | § 888.00 | § 19.00 | § 950.00 NOBID $ 500 % 25000 § 4166 | § 20830018 11.00 | § 550.00
9030400 Temporary Sediment Check Dams 10 EACH $ 15000 | § 1,500.00 ) § 630.00 | § 6,300.00 NO BID $ 50000 | § 500000 | § 22170 8§ 221700 8 13500 | § 1,350.00
8030500 Temporary Silt Fencing 1500 LF § 25018 3,750,00 | § 400(% 6,000.00 NOBID $ 200§ 3,00000| 143 | 8 214500 | § 200|8 3,000.00
9070218 Concrete Curb and Gutter 200 LF $ 28008 5,600.00 | § 38008 7,600.00 NO BID $ 6000 § 12,000.00 | % 39608 7920001 8 36.00 | $ 7,200.00
9070304 4" Concrete Walk 800 SY $ 5500 | $ 44,000.00 | § 7600 § 60,800.00 NOBID $ 4000 | § 32,00000 ] § 7370 | § 58,960.00 | § 4500 ] § 36,000.00
9070408 8" Concrete Drive 200 sY $ 7500 % 15,000.00 | § 9500 § 19,000.00 NO BID $ 30000 | § 60,00000) § 99.00] % 19,800.00 | § 145.00 | § 29,000.00
9999001 Installation of Selected Generator Size (kW) - 10 72 EACH $ 77200 | § 5558400 8 73000 % 52,560.00 NO BID $ 4,00000 | § 268,00000 | $ 289750 | § 208,620.00 | § 79000 | § 56,880.00
9999002 Installation of Selected Generator Size (kW) - 20 66 EACH $ 77200 | § 50,952.00 | § 73000 | § 48,180.00 NO BID $ 400000 § 264,00000 ] § 289750 | § 191,235.00 | § 800.00 | § 52,800.00
9999003 Installation of Selected Generator Size (kW) - 30 2 EACH $ 77200 % 154400 % 750.00 | § 1,500.00 NOBID $ 4,000.00 | § 8000001 § 365875 | 8 7317501 % 1,263.00 | § 2,526.00
9999005 Installation of Selected Generator Size (kW) - 40 54 EACH $ 89000 | § 48,060.00 | § 800.00 | § 43,200.00 NO BID $ 4.000.00 | § 21600000 § 365875 | § 197,572500 8  1,530.00 | § 82,620.00
9999007 Installation of Selected Generator Size (kW) - 60 42 EACH § 890.00 [ § 37,380.00 | § 80000 | § 33,600.00 NO BID $ 4,00000 | § 168,000.00 | § 523250 | § 21976500 1§ 1,26000 /% 52,920.00
9999008 Installation of Selected Generator Size (kW) - 80 24 EACH $ 1,008.00 ] % 29,232000% 100000 § 29,000.00 NO BID $ 4,000.00 | § 116,00000 | § 523250 | § 151742500 §  1,280.00 | § 37,120.00
9999009 Installation of Selected Generator Size (kW) - 100 16 EACH 5 1458.00 | 8 233280018 105000 8 16,800.00 NO BID $ 4,00000| § 64,000.00 | $ 5545.00 | § 887200018 156100 |§ 24,976.00
9999010 Installation of Selected Generator Size (kW) - 125 6 EACH $ 145800 | § 874800|8  1,200.00 | § 7,200.00 NO BID $ 400000 | § 2400000 § 6,795.00 | § 40770008  1611.00|§ 9,666.00
99999011 Installation of Selected Generator Size (kW) - 150 5 EACH $ 1,794.00 | § 8970.00% 650000]8 32,500.00 NO BID $ 4,00000 | § 20,000.00 | § 6,795.00 | § 33975.001$ 186000 )% 9,300.00
9999015 Installation of Selected Generator Size (kW) - 600 1 EACH 5 6,500.00 | § 6,500008 710000 | § 7,100.00 NOBID $ 5,000.00 | § 500000] § 19.760.00 | § 19,760.00 | § 23,740.00 | § 23,740.00
9999016 Gen. Foundation Detail 1 Unit Cost 444 CY $ 1,00000 | § 4440000008 270000 § 1,198,800.00 NOBID 5 2,000.00 | § 888,000.00 | § 1,133.00 | § 503,052.00 | § 655.00 | § 290,820.00
9999017 Gen, Foundation Detail 2 or 3 Unit Cost 348 CY $ 1,20000 | § 415,200.00 | 8 1,400.00 | § 484,400.00 NOBID § 1,20000 | § 415,200.00 | § 1,221.00 | § 422,466.00 | $ 755.00 | § 261,230.00
9999018 General Electrical Installation Detail - A - 100 Amp 53 EACH $ 9,900.00 | § 52470000]$ 11,00000 | § 583,000.00 NO BID §  21,68000| § 1,149,040.00 | § 1394250 | § 73895250 1§ 11,726.00 | § 621,478.00
9999019 General Electrical Installation Detail - B - 100 Amp 3 EACH 5 11,900.00 | § 36890000 §  11,00000 | § 341,000.00 NOBID § 2168000 % 672,080.00 | § 1394250 | § 43221750 | §  11,94200 | § 370,202.00
9998020 General Electrical Installation Detail - C - 100 Amp 37 EACH 3 733700 % 2714690015 1000000 ) § 370,000.00 NO BID $ 18,480.00 | $ 683,760.00 | § 1144250 | § 42337250 $ 826900 | % 305,953.00
9999021 General Electrical Installation Detail - D - 100 Amp 30 EACH § 6318008 189,540.00 | $ 850000 § 255,000.00 NO BID $ 18,480.00 | § 554,400.00 | $ 11,442.50 | § 34327500 §  6,936.00 | § 208,080.00
9999022 General Electrical Installation Detail - E - 100 Amp & EACH b 11,979.00 | § 71874001 % 1190000 | § 71,400.00 NO BID $ 18,480.00 | § 11088000 | § 2226000 | § 13356000 | §  9.263.00 | § 55,578.00
9999023 General Electrical Installation Detail - F - 100 Amp 1 EACH $ 11,900.00 | § 1190000 | § 1250000 | § 12,500.00 NO BID $ 21,680.00 | § 21680000 § 2163500 % 2163500 § 1745400 [ § 17,454.00
9999025 General Electrical Instaliation Detall - H - 100 Amp 1 EACH $ 15,340.00 | § 1534000 | §  17,500.00 | § 17,500.00 NO BID $ 18,480.00 | § 18480000 5 2163500 [ § 216350008 930000 % 9,300.00
9999026 General Electrical Installation Detail - J - 100 Amp 5 EACH $ 10,856.00 | $ 54,280.00|§ 13,000.00 | § 65,000.00 NO BID $ 1848000 § 92400000 § 2163500 | § 108,175.00 | §  9,400.00 [ § 47,000.00
9999027 General Electrical Installation Detail - A - 200 Amp 16 EACH $ 12,250.00 | § 196,000.00 | § 1300000 § 208,000.00 NO BID $ 3532000 | § 56512000 | § 17,692.50 | § 283080001 % 877000|% 140,320.00
9999028 General Electrical Installation Detail - B - 200 Amp 16 EACH $ 14,700.00 | § 235200008 1550000 | 248,000.00 NO BID $ 2542000 | § 40672000 | § 17,692.50 | § 283,080,001 % 1060200 |5 169,632.00
9999029 General Electrical Installation Detail - C - 200 Amp 64 EACH $ 8,816.00 | § 564224001 % 10,00000 | § 640,000.00 NOBID 3 22,22000 | § 142208000 § 1394200 % 892288000 % 822100 % 526,144.00
9999030 General Electrical Installation Detail - D - 200 Amp 28 EACH $ 6,685.00 | § 18718000 | § 850000 § 238,000.00 NOBID $ 2222000 § 622160001 $ 1581750 | § 442890000 8842008 247 ,576.00
9999031 General Electrical Installation Detail - E - 200 Amp 2 EACH 5 11,800.00 | § 2360000 % 1410000 § 28,200.00 NOBID $ 22,22000 | § 444400018 24135008 48270001 5 1415600 | % 28,312.00
9999032 General Electrical Installation Detail - J - 200 Amp 1 EACH $ 18,880.00 | § 18,880.00 | §  21,00000 | § 21,000.00 NO BID §  2200000] % 22000001 § 2413500 § 2413500 § 1314200 § 13,142.00
9999033 General Electrical Installation Detail - C - 400 Amp 2 EACH $ 2242000 % 4484000| % 2550000 ) % 51,000.00 NOBID $ 3740000 § 74800005 4030500 8§ 80610001 § 13670008 27,340.00
9999038 General Electrical Installation Detail - | - 1000 Amp 1 EACH $ 77,526.00 | § 7752600 | § 8450000 § 84,500.00 NO BID 5 46,750.00 | § 46,750.00 | § 58,575.00 | § 585750018 4135500 % 41,355.00
9995039 General Requirements 296 EACH $ 3,300.00 | § 976,80000 | 248000 ] § 734,080.00 NO BID $ 6,703.00 | § 1,984,088.00 | § 1485125 | § 439597000 § 5645008 1,670,920.00




minor mathematical errors in Bid Form I

9999040 5KVA Tra EACH 5 590.00 | § 59,000.00 | § 00 $ 63,200.00 $ $ $ 113063 $ 113,063.00 | § 00]s 125,600.00
9399041 Anchor for Portable Generators 7 EACH $ 90000 § 630000 | §_ 1.80000 | § 12,600.00 NO BID §_ 1,00000[§ 700000|$ 246000 | § 1722000 731005 5,117.00
9999042 Asphalt Concrete Pavement 300 sY s 7000 [ § 21,00000|§ 5100 § 15,300.00 NOBID s 3000 § 900000|§ 15499 46497.00]S 75008 22,500.00
9999043 Backflow Preventer Relocation 15 EACH s 3,540.00 [ $ 5310000 | S 120000 § 18,000.00 NO BID s 50000 | § 750000 S 242000 $ %30000]s 46100 691500
9999044 | 12 FL Wide, Wood, Double Gate - 6 . Height 254 EACH s 70000 $ 177,80000]8  91500[§ 232410.00 NOBID § 80000 S 20320000| 8 71500] § 18161000 | S 40300(§ 102,362.00
9999045 Retaining Wall 45 cY $ 1,50000 | § 67,50000 |5 1,450.00 | § 65.250.00 NO BID $ 300008 1350000]§ 80300 § 3%13500( 125008 5,625.00
9999046 Steel Platforms 45000 LB $ 5718 25695000 | § 300§ 135,000.00 NO BID $ - s 565]$ 254,250.00 | § 193]s 86,850.00
9999047 Bollards 100 EACH $ 500.00 | § 50,000.00 | $ 75000 | § 75,000.00 NOBID 5 - | § 24750 8 2475000 8 183.00 | § 18,300.00
9999100 Utiity Relocation Allowance 1 LUMP S 100,00000 | § 100,00000 | §100,000.00 | $ 100,000.00 NOBID 5 $ 10000000 § 100,000.00 | S 100,000.00 [ § 100,000.00
9999101 | Installation of Sedected Generator Size (kW) - 250 3 EACH $ 6,50000 | $ 1950000 |$ 500000 | § 15,000.00 NOBID $ $_ 10187.50 ] § 3056250 |'§ 5168500 § 155,055.00
9999102 | General Eleclrical Installation Detail - G - 200 1 EACH § 35400008 3540000 | 37,00000[ § 37,00000 NO BID s § 2538500 § 2538500 ]S 13368003 13,368.00
9999103 General Eleciical Installation Detail -1 - 400 1 EACH § 47,0003 47,2000 |$ 50,000.00 | § 50,000.00 NO BID s § 5857500 S 5657500 | 5 12,303.00 [ $ 12,303.00

TOTAL BID s 47878005 |[SINNNNINEEISHBIORN § 51554500 | § 7,897,848.00 | $ [s - |s +4689400]s 12070202005 63326776 |[SNNNNNGIOORIHAIONY] 5 +27.536.67 | 5 7.102,284.52 |




